ORDINANCE NO. 1511-06-2022

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF GAINESVILLE, TEXAS, REPEALING
THE 2015 EDITION OF CERTAIN INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODES
PUBLISHED BY THE INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL; AMENDING
THE CITY OF GAINESVILLE’S CODE OF ORDINANCES CHAPTER 5:
BUILDING AND BUILDING REGULATIONS, ARTICLE I: BUILDING
STANDARDS, SECTIONS 5-1, 5-2, 5-3, 5-4, 5-5, 5-6, 5-7 5-8, 5-9 , 5-10, 5-11, 5-
12 AND 5-13; PROVIDING FOR ADOPTION BY REFERENCE OF
CERTAIN 2018 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODES AND STANDARDS
AND LOCAL AMENDMENTS, ESTABLISHING CERTAIN BUILDING
REGULATIONS AND REQUIREMENTS; PROVIDING FOR A FINDINGS
CLAUSE; PROVIDING FOR A SEVERABILITY CLAUSE; PROVIDING
FOR A CONFLICTS CLAUSE; AND PROVIDING FOR AN EFFECTIVE
DATE.

WHEREAS, the Texas Local Governmental Code empowers the City to enact building codes and
regulations and provide for their administration, enforcement, and amendment; and

WHEREAS, the City recognizes that some construction techniques and materials have changed
since it last adopted the 2015 International Code Council Codes, and the NFPA 70; and

WHEREAS, the City recognizes the importance of its International Standards Organization (ISO)
Rating and the dependence of that rating on the City’s adopting the most recent codes published by the
International Code Council; and

WHERAS, the North Central Texas Council of Governments hosted a working group comprised of
industry representatives and building officials across the North Texas area to draft amendments to the 2018
International Codes to meet the requirements of the region; and

WHEREAS, the City finds it is in the interests and welfare of its citizens to repeal the 2015
International Building Codes and adopt the updated 2018 International Building Code and other associated
building codes with amendments.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
GAINESVILLE, TEXAS:

SECTION 1
FINDINGS

The above and foregoing recitals are hereby found to be true and correct and are incorporated herein as
findings of fact. The City Council hereby further finds and determines that the rules, regulations, terms,
conditions, provisions and requirements of this Ordinance are reasonable and necessary to protect the public
health, safety and quality of life.

SECTION 2
ADOPTION OF CONSTRUCTION AND TECHNICAL CODES

The 2018 International Building Code, the International Residential Code, the International Existing
Building Code, the International Fire Code, the International Mechanical Code, the International Plumbing
Code, the International Fuel and Gas Code, the International Energy Conservation Code, the International
Property Maintenance Code, the International Swimming Pool and Spa Code, and the 2017 National
Electrical Code (NFPA 70) save and except the amendments set forth in Exhibit “A”, attached hereto and



incorporated herein is adopted as the construction and technical codes for the City of Gainesville. A copy
of each code with amendments is on file in the Community Development Office.

SECTION 3
PENALTY CLAUSE

Any person, firm, or corporation violating any of the provisions or terms of this Ordinance shall be subject
to a fine in the amount up to two thousand dollars ($2,000.00). Each and every violation or day such
violation continues or exists shall be deemed a separate offense. The provision of this Ordinance can also
be enforced by injunction, suit, civil action, and civil penalty for any violation as authorized by law.

SECTION 4
CUMULATIVE REPEALER CLAUSE
This ordinance shall be cumulative of all provisions of ordinances of the City of Gainesville, Texas, and
shall not repeal any of the provisions of said ordinances except where the provisions of this ordinance are
in direct conflict with the provisions of such ordinances, in which event the conflicting provisions of such
ordinances are hereby repealed to the extent of such conflict. All other provisions of ordinance of the City
of Gainesville, Texas not in direct conflict with this ordinance shall remain in full force and effect.

SECTION 5
SAVINGS CLAUSE

All rights and remedies of the City of Gainesville, Texas are expressly saved as to any and all violations of
the provisions of any other ordinance, which have secured at the time of the effective date of this Ordinance;
and, as to such accrued violations and all pending litigation, both civil and criminal, whether pending in
court or not, under such ordinances same shall not be affected by this Ordinance but may be prosecuted
until final disposition by the court.

SECTION 6
SEVERABILITY

The sections, paragraphs, sentences, phrases, clauses, and words of this ordinance are severable, and if any
section, paragraph, sentence, phrase, clause or word in this ordinance or application thereof to any person
or circumstances is held invalid or unconstitutional by a court of competent jurisdiction, such holding shall
not affect the validity of the remaining portions of this ordinance, and the City Council hereby declares that
it would have passed such remaining portions of this ordinance despite such invalidity, which remaining
portions shall remain in full force and effect.

SECTION 7
ENGROSSMENT AND ENROLLMENT

The City Secretary of the City of Gainesville, Texas, is hereby directed to engross and enroll this ordinance
by copying the caption, publication clause, penalty clause, and effective date clause in the minutes of the
City Council of the City of Gainesville and by filing this ordinance in the ordinance records of the City.

SECTION 8
EFFECTIVE DATE

This ordinance shall become effective immediately upon its passage and publication as required by law.



INTRODUCTION, FIRST READING, CHARTER SUSPENSION

INTRODUCED AND READ BEFORE THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF GAINESVILLE
ON THE 7™ DAY OF JUNE, 2022, AT WHICH THE CHARTER PROVISION OF THE CITY
OF GAINESVILLE REQUIRING THE READING OF THE ORDINANCE ON THREE
SEPARATE OCCASIONS WAS SUSPENDED BY A VOTE:

A vV AYES O U NAYS OABSENCES O _ O ABSTENTIONS
~~—"Diana Alcala, C City Secretary TommyyMoore Mayor
ADOPTION

ADOPTED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF GAINESVILLE ON THE 7"HDAY OF
JUNE, 2022:

-’[ AYES © NAYS _— ABSENCES ~ ©  ABSTENTIONS

”/

/ ommy Modére, Mayor

=




“Exhibit A.”

Chapter 5 Buildings and Building Regulations, Article I Building Standards shall read:
Sec. 5-1. Technical Codes Adopted

(a) The following technical code are hereby adopted with all amendments and specified appendices by the city:

(1) 2018 International Building Code

(2) 2018 International Residential Code+

(3) 2018 International Existing Building Code

(4) 2018 International Fire Code with appendices

(5) 2017 National Electric Code NFPA 70

(6) 2018 International Plumbing Code

(7) 2018 International Fuel Gas Code

(8) 2018 International Mechanical Code

(9) 2018 International Energy Conservation Code

(10) 2018 International Property Maintenance Code
(11) 2018 International Swimming Pool and Spa Code

(b) A copy of each code and such future amendments shall be retained in the Community Development Department

of the City of Gainesville, Texas.

Sec. 5-2. General exceptions and amendments applicable to all technical codes.

[General exceptions and amendments]

(1) In all code editions, the “name of jurisdiction” where mentioned, shall mean the City of Gainesville, Texas.

(2) All references in the technical codes to flood-related issues shall also include reference to the City of
Gainesville Flood Control Ordinance.

(3) All references to “Board of Appeals” shall mean the City of Gainesville Board of Appeals and their adopted
regulations

(4) All references to the “Department of Building Safety” and various other types of inspection agencies shall
the City of Gainesville Community Development Department.

(5) Where used, the term “code official” or similar related titles, shall mean the Community Development
Director or his/her appointed representatives.

(6) Where used, the term “fire official” shall mean the “Fire Marshal” or his/her appointed representatives.

(7) Decisions and interpretations of code issues by the code official or fire official are final unless otherwise
provided as part of the Board of Appeals process.

(8) Where mentioned, the phrases “permit fees,” “permit schedule” or similar terms shall refer to the City of
Gainesville Fee Schedule. The City Council shall, by resolution, establish a schedule of fees for permits,
certificates of occupancy, zoning change requests, plat review and recording, Board of Appeals, Building
Standards Commission, and Planning and Zoning Commission, for other matters pertaining to this article,
and a collection procedure for the administration thereof.

(9) Once permit applications are approved and signed by the Building Official or his/her representative, a permit
shall be issued and signed by the applicant.



(10) No permits for new buildings, structure or developments shall be issued until the stormwater drainage plan
and calculations have been reviewed and approved by city staff.

(11) No permits shall be issued for new construction or remodeling work of a commercial structure that involves
the demolition of walls, removal of sheetrock, floor tile or other building components until an asbestos
survey/inspection is done in accordance with state law. A copy of the inspections must be presented to obtain
a permit. If asbestos containing materials are found, a copy of the report covering the abatement of the
material must also be presented before a permit can be issued.

(12) Where “refund policy” is mentioned in the various codes, it shall refer to the City of Gainesville refund
policy which allows, when requested in writing and approved, within the first week of a permit being issued,
a full refund to be granted. From one (1) week to thirty (30) days, half of the permit fee may be refunded.
After thirty (30) days, no refund will be given. However, a refund may be considered for approval only if not
work or construction of any kind has been started on the project. No refunds will be issued for fees associated
with third party reviews and/or inspections.

(13) Permits are not transferable from one (1) person or contractor to another.

(14) Any condition or nonconformance that escapes the notice of the inspector during the course of normal
inspections is still the responsibility of the contractor or owner to correct.

(15) All references in the technical code that refer to accessibility or ADA issues shall use the State of Texas
Architectural Barrier Standards when the state standard is more restrictive.

(16) Notice or citations sent by certified mail that have return receipts stamped unclaimed or undeliverable shall
be deemed to have been delivered, per Texas Local Government Code Sec. 54.035 (f).

(17) Citations may be issued for violations of the provisions of all adopted and amended technical codes. The
maximum fine per violation is two-thousand dollars ($2,000.00) per day, with each day that violation exists
or continues being a separate violation.

(18) All general contractors, contractors of major trades and contractors with state licenses shall register with the
city prior to starting any work in the city. A copy of their liability insurance or a surety bond in the amount
of $1,000,000 per occurrence is required.

(19) Wood shingles and shakes are not permitted in the City of Gainesville.

(20) Before any water, gas, or electric service is extended to any new construction, the requisite permit shall first
- have been paid for and obtained from the city.

(21) All new subdivisions shall have underground electric services to structures.
(22) Permits for accessory building will be granted only for premises where a primary structure already exists.

(23) All single family dwellings hereinafter constructed shall be provided with off-street parking space for two
(2) automobiles at the time of original construction. These spaces shall not be single row spaces, and designed
such that no portion of either vehicle encroaches into the minimum area reserved for front, rear, and side
yards. For drives fifty-five (55) feet or less in length from the property line to the home, the drives must be
concrete or asphalt. For properties with drives longer than fifty-five (55) feet from the property line to the
home, the drive approach plus ten feet past the property line must be concrete or asphalt. The remainder of
the drive may be gravel with a minimum of two concrete or asphalt parking spaces at the home.

(24) Where the owner of an existing dwelling desires to convert garage space into living area, such construction
shall conform to the city’s building codes. Plans for the conversion shall be submitted as required by the city
building official at the time of application for a building permit. Furthermore, parking space must be retained
that is adequate for two (2) vehicles, such that no portion of either vehicle encroaches in the minimum area
reserved for front, rear, and side yards. Finally, no new carport of garage shall constructed in front of the old
garage unless the required setbacks can be met. No carport shall extend closer to the front property line than
the primary structure.



(25) The minimum living area for any new residential building shall be one thousand two hundred (1,200) square
feet (of air conditioned space), not including the garage nor uncovered/covered decks and patios.

(26) The city does not enforce deed restrictions.

(27) All commercial buildings require an asbestos survey by a state-certified asbestos inspector prior to the
issuance of a permit for any type of demolition work. If any asbestos is found, it must be abated prior to the
issuance of any demolition permits. Asbestos surveys are required for each commercial permit issued,
regardless of previous surveys that may have been submitted.

(28) Foundations and flatwork for a demolished structure or building shall also be demolished at the same time
as the demolition of the building and removed from the property.

(29) References in the various codes to “atmospheric-type vacuum breaker,” “pressure-type vacuum breaker”
and “reduced pressure principle backflow preventer” for lawn irrigation systems shall be replaced with
“double-check backflow preventer assembly.”

(30) Additional foundation requirements.

1. Whenever a provision of this section or any other provision of this article, or any provision in any
other law, ordinance, resolution, rule or regulation of any kind contains any restrictions covering any
of the same subject matter, whichever restrictions are more restrictive or impose higher standards or
requirements shall govern. Any provisions of this section that are in conflict with state law shall be
governed by the state law to the extent of the conflict only.

2. For residential accessory structures with foundations, all interior spot piers located above ground
shall be constructed of poured concrete tied with a minimum of four (4), 14" steel reinforcing bars
centered in the pier. Footings shall be a minimum of eighteen (18) inches deep with a minimum
twelve (12) inches of depth in undisturbed soil and ten (10) inches in width with four (4), 5/8” steel
reinforcement bars.

3. All commercial and residential slab foundations shall be engineered other than residential accessory
structures. (See (30) (b) above.) Professionally engineered slab design documentation must be
submitted prior to permitting.

4. The finished floor elevation of foundations not located in flood zones shall be at least twelve (12)
inches above the top of curb or edge of street elevation, whichever is higher. In the event that the
grading of a lot is not suitable for this rule an alternate grading plan must be submitted for approval.
The alternate plan must include provisions for storm water drainage. Foundations located in flood
zones must comply with the provisions of the City of Gainesville Flood Control Ordinance.

(31) Contractors shall insure all required setbacks addressed by the City of Gainesville Zoning Ordinance are
observed.

(32) Contractors are responsible for notifying the Community Development Department when they have stages
of construction ready for inspection.

(33) All new swimming pools shall be constructed in accordance with the Virginia Graeme Baker Pool and Spa
Act of 2007.

(34) All fire code amendments shall also apply to the related section of the adopted building code or other
referenced code.

(35) Certificates of occupancy shall not be issued until all deficiencies noted on the inspection forms have been
corrected. Deficiencies shall be corrected within two (2) weeks of the date of the inspection. Extensions of
time shall be requested in writing giving reasons for the request.

(36) Certificate of occupancy may be revoked at any time and utilities ordered to be disconnected by the Building
Official or the Fire Marshal for nonconformance with city or state codes or ordinances.



(37) General contractors are responsible for maintaining grass, weeds, trash, and other code enforcement-related
issues during the course of their projects.

(38) Real estate agents, property management companies, auction companies and similar entities are responsible
for grass, weeds, and other code enforcement issues for properties under their control.

(39) Roofs shall be of one (1) color shingles or other approved roofing material.
(40) Houses shall not be painted in stripes, checks, swirls or similar types of patterns.
Sec. 5-3. - Specific amendments to the 2018 International Building Code.

(1) 101.4 Referenced Codes. The other codes listed in Sections 101.4.1 through 101.4.8 and referenced
elsewhere in this code, when specifically adopted, shall be considered part of the requirements of this code
to the prescribed extent of each such reference. Whenever amendments have been adopted to the referenced
codes and standards, each reference to said code and standard shall be considered to reference the
amendments as well. Any reference to NFPA 70 or the Electrical Code shall mean the Electrical Code as
adopted.

(2) 101.4.8 Electrical. The provisions of the Electrical Code shall apply to the installation of electrical systems,
including alterations, repairs, replacement, equipment, appliances, fixtures, fittings and appurtenances
thereto.

(3) 104 DUTIES AND POWERS OF THE BUILDING OFFICIAL; The following sections are deleted:

104.2.1 Determination of substantially improved or substantially damaged existing buildings and
structures in flood hazard areas.

104.10.1 Flood hazard areas.

(4) Section 105 PERMITS; added the following sentence:

Permits for projects in a floodplain area also require an approved Floodplain Development Permit prior to
the issuance of a building permit.

(5) Deleted paragraphs 105.1.1 Annual permits and paragraph 105.1.2 Annual permit records.
(6) Paragraph 105.2 Work exempt from permits. Under Buildings, deleted subparagraphs 1—6 and 9-13.
(7) 109.7 Re-inspection Fee. A fee as established by city council resolution may be charged when:
1. The inspection called for is not ready when the inspector arrives;
No building address or permit card is clearly posted,

City approved plans are not on the job site available to the inspector;

2
3
4. The building is locked or work otherwise not available for inspection when called;
5. The job site is red-tagged twice for the same item;

6. The original red tag has been removed from the job site.

7. Failure to maintain erosion control, trash control or tree protection.

Any re-inspection fees assessed shall be paid before any more inspections are made on that job site.

(8) Section 110.3.5; Lath, gypsum board and gypsum panel product inspection. Delete the following
exception:

Exception: Gypsum board and gypsum panel products that are not part of a fire resistance rated assembly
or a shear assembly.

(9) Section 111 CERTIFICATE OF OCCUPANCY; added the following paragraph:

111.2.1: Each new tenant or owner shall require a new Certificate of Occupancy.

(10) Section 115.2 Issuance; add the following to the end of paragraph:



A stop work order may also be posted in a conspicuous place at the job site and shall state the nature of
the violation.

(11) Section 116.3 Notice; add the following sentence to the end of the paragraph:

Rejection of the terms shall refer the case to the appropriate city authority as determined by City Council
for a final determination.

(12) Section 202 DEFINITIONS

AMBULATORY CARE FACILITY. Buildings or portions thereof used to provide medical, surgical,
psychiatric, nursing or similar care on a less than 24-hour basis to individuals who are rendered incapable
of self-preservation by the services provided. This group may include but not be limited to the following:

- Dialysis centers
- Sedation dentistry
- Surgery centers
- Colonic centers
- Psychiatric centers

ASSISTED LIVING FACILITIES. A building or part thereof housing persons, on a 24-hour basis, who
because of age, mental disability or other reasons, live in a supervised residential environment which
provides personal care services. The occupants are capable of responding to an emergency situation
without physical assistance from staff.

ATRIUM. An opening connecting three or more stories... {Balance remains unchanged}

HIGH-RISE BUILDING. A building with an occupied floor located more than 55 feet (16,764) above
the lowest level of fire department vehicle access.

SHORT TERM RENTAL (STR). The rental of a room, loft, or entire home for 30 to 180 days per
calendar year to transient guests who have paid for accommodations.

FIRE SEPARATION DISTANCE

4. In no case shall the fire separation distance between commercial/industrial buildings on the same
lot be less than 24 feet in any direction. Any other distance, whether greater or smaller, shall be
determined on a case by case basis by the Fire Marshal.

REPAIR GARAGE. A building, structure or portion thereof used for servicing or repairing motor
vehicles. This occupancy shall also include garages involved in minor repair, modification and servicing
of motor vehicles for items such as lube changes, inspections, windshield repair or replacement, shocks,
minor part replacement and other such minor repairs.

SPECIAL INSPECTOR. A qualified person employed or retained by an approved agency who shall
prove to the satisfaction of the registered design professional in responsible charge and the Building
Official as having the competence necessary to inspect a particular type of construction requiring special
inspection.

(19) Section 303.1.3; add a sentence to read as follows:

303.1.3 Associated with Group E occupancies. A room or space used for assembly purposes that is
associated with a Group E occupancy is not considered a separate occupancy except when applying the
assembly requirements of Chapter 10 and 11.

(20) Section 304.1; add the following to the list of occupancies:



Fire stations
Police stations with detention facilities for 5 or less

(21) Section 307.1.1; add the following sentence to Exception 4:

4. Cleaning establishments... {Text unchanged} ...with Section 707 or 1-hour horizontal assemblies
constructed in accordance with Section 711 or both. See also IFC Chapter 21, Dry Cleaning Plant
provisions.

(22) Section 310.1 Residential Group R. Add the following:

Residential Group R includes the use of a building or structure or a portion thereof for sleeping purposes
when not classified as an Institutional Group I. Residential Occupancies shall include the following:

Residential occupancies containing sleeping units where the occupants are primarily transient in
nature, including:

Short Term Rentals
Boarding Houses (transient)
Hotels (transient)

Motels (transient)

Congregant living facilities (transient) with 10 or fewer occupants are permitted to comply with the
construction requirements for Group R-3.

(23)  Section 403.1, Exception 3; change to read as follows:

3. The open air portion of a building {remainder unchanged}

(24)  Section 403.3, Exception; delete item 2.
(25)  Section 403.3.2; change to read as follows:

[F] 403.3.2 Water supply to required fire pumps. In buildings that are more than 120 feet (36.5 m) in
building height, required fire pumps shall be supplied by connections to no fewer than two water mains
located in different streets. Separate supply piping shall be provided between each connection to the water
main and the pumps. Each connection and the supply piping between the connection and the pumps shall
be sized to supply the flow and pressure required for the pumps to operate.

Exception: {No change to exception.}

(26) Section 404.5; delete Exception.
(27)  Delete Section 406.3.5.1 Carport separation.
(28)  Section 406.8 Repair Garages. Add a second paragraph to read as follows:

This occupancy shall also include garages involved in minor repair, modification and servicing of motor
vehicles for items such as lube changes, inspections, windshield repair or replacement, shocks, minor part
replacement and other such minor repairs.

(29) Delete SECTION 423 STORM SHELTERS. Add the following sentence to read as follows:

All schools shall follow state law requirements for construction of storm shelters and/or safe rooms.

(30) Section 506.3.2.1; add sentence to read as follows:

506.2.2.2 Open Space Limits. Such open space shall be either on the same lot or dedicated for public use
and shall be accessed from a street or approved fire lane. In order to be considered as accessible, if not in
direct contact with a street or fire lane, a minimum 10-foot wide pathway meeting fire department access
from the street or approved fire lane shall be provided.



(31) Section 712.1.9, change item 5 to read as follows:

4. Is not open to a corridor in Group I and H occupancies.

(32) Section 713.14.1. Add the following exception:

Elevators serving four levels over 55 feet (16,764 mm) above the lowest level of fire department vehicle
access in high-rise buildings.

(33) Section 901.6.1; add Section 901.6.1.1 to read as follows:

901.6.1.1 Standpipe Testing. Building owners/managers must maintain and test standpipe systems as per
NFPA 25 requirements. The following additional requirements shall be applied to the testing that is
required every 5 years:

1. The piping between the Fire Department Connection (FDC) and the standpipe shall be back-
flushed when foreign material is present, and also hydrostatically tested for all FDC's on any type of
standpipe system. Hydrostatic testing shall also be conducted in accordance with NFPA 25
requirements for the different types of standpipe systems. North Central Texas Council of
Governments 6 As of August 2015 IBC Amendments.

2. For any manual (dry or wet) standpipe system not having an automatic water supply capable of
flowing water through the standpipe, the tester shall connect hose from a fire hydrant or portable
pumping system (as approved by the fire code official) to each FDC, and flow water through the
standpipe system to the roof outlet to verify that each inlet connection functions properly. Confirm
that there are no open hose valves prior to introducing water into a dry standpipe. There is no
required pressure criteria at the outlet. Verify that check valves function properly and that there are
no closed control valves on the system.

3. Any pressure relief, reducing, or control valves shall be tested in accordance with the requirements
of NFPA 25. All hose valves shall be exercised.

4. If the FDC is not already provided with approved caps, the contractor shall install such caps for all
FDC's as required by the fire code official.

5. Upon successful completion of standpipe test, place a blue tag (as per Texas Administrative Code,
Fire Sprinkler Rules for Inspection, Test and Maintenance Service (ITM) Tag) at the bottom of each
standpipe riser in the building. The tag shall be check-marked as "Fifth Year" for Type of ITM, and
the note on the back of the tag shall read "5 Year Standpipe Test" at a minimum.

6. The procedures required by Texas Administrative Code Fire Sprinkler Rules with regard to
Yellow Tags and Red Tags or any deficiencies noted during the testing, including the required
notification of the local Authority Having Jurisdiction (fire code official) shall be followed.

7. Additionally, records of the testing shall be maintained by the owner and contractor, if applicable,
as required by the State Rules mentioned above and NFPA 25.

8. Standpipe system tests where water will be flowed external to the building shall not be conducted
during freezing conditions or during the day prior to expected night time freezing conditions.

9. Contact the fire code official for requests to remove existing fire hose from Class II and III
standpipe systems where employees are not trained in the utilization of this firefighting equipment.
All standpipe hose valves must remain in place and be provided with an approved cap and chain
when approval is given to remove hose by the fire code official.

(34) Section 903.1.1; change to read as follows:

[F] 903.1.1 Alternative protection. Alternative automatic fire-extinguishing systems complying with
Section 904 shall be permitted in addition to automatic sprinkler protection where recognized by the
applicable standard or as approved by the fire code official.



(35) Section 903.2; add the following:

[F] 903.2 Where required. Approved automatic sprinkler systems in new buildings and structures shall
be provided in the locations described in Sections 903.2.1 through 903.2.12. Automatic Sprinklers shall
not be installed in elevator machine rooms, elevator machine spaces, and elevator hoistways, other than
pits where such sprinklers would not necessitate shunt trip requirements under any circumstances. Storage
shall not be allowed within the elevator machine room. Signage shall be provided at the entry doors to the
elevator machine room indicating "ELEVATOR MACHINERY-NO STORAGE ALLOWED."

(36) Section 903.2; delete the exception.

(37) Add to the end of 903.2.8, "...in accordance with the International Fire Code as adopted by the City of
Gainesville and where required by state law."

(38) Section 903.2.9; add Section 903.2.9.3 to read as follows:

[F] 903.2.9.3 Self-service storage facility. An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed throughout
all enclosed self-service storage facilities in excess of 6,000 square feet.

Exception: One-story self-service storage facilities that have no interior corridors, with a one-hour
fire barrier separation wall installed between every storage compartment.

(39) Section 903.2.11; change 903.2.11.3 and add 903.2.11.7, 903.2.11.8, and 903.2.11.9 as follows:

903.2.11.3 Buildings 35 feet or more in height. An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed
throughout buildings that have one or more stories other than penthouses in compliance with Section
1510 of the International Building Code, located 35 feet (10,668 mm) or more above the lowest level of
fire department vehicle access, measured to the finished floor.

Exception:

Open parking structures in compliance with Section 406.5 of the International Building Code,
having no other occupancies above the subject garage.

(40) Add the following section:

903.2.11.7 High-Piled Combustible Storage. For any building with a clear height exceeding 12 feet
(4572 mm), see Chapter 32 of the IFC to determine if those provisions apply.

(41) Add the following section:

903.2.11.8 Spray Booths and Rooms. New and existing spray booths and spraying rooms shall be
protected by an approved automatic fire-extinguishing system.

(42) Section 903.3.1.1.1; change to read as follows:

[F] 903.3.1.1.1 Exempt locations. When approved by the fire code official, automatic sprinklers shall not
be required in the following rooms or areas where such ... {text unchanged} ... because it is damp, of fire
resistance-rated construction or contains electrical equipment.

1. Any room where the application of water, or flame and water, constitutes a serious life or fire
hazard.

2. Any room or space where sprinklers are considered undesirable because of the nature of the
contents, when approved by the code official.

3. Generator and transformer rooms, under the direct control of a public utility, separated from the
remainder of the building by walls and floor/ceiling or roof/ceiling assemblies having a fire
resistance rating of not less than 2 hours.

4. Elevator machine rooms, and machinery spaces, and hoist ways, other than pits where such
sprinklers would not necessitate shunt trip requirements under any circumstances.



(43) Section 903.3.1.2.3; add section to read as follows:

[F] Section 903.3.1.2.3 Attics, Open Breezeways, and Attached Garages. Sprinkler protection is
required in attic spaces of such buildings two or more stories in height, in accordance with NFPA 13 and
or NFPA 13R requirements, open breezeways, and attached garages.

(44) Section 903.3.1.3; change to read as follows:

[F] 903.3.1.3 NFPA 13D sprinkler systems. Automatic sprinkler systems installed in one- and two-
family dwellings; Group R-3; Group R-4 Condition 1 and townhouses shall be permitted to be installed
throughout in accordance with NFPA 13D or in accordance with state law.

(45) Section 903.3.1.4; add to read as follows:
[F] 903.3.1.4 Freeze protection. Freeze protection systems for automatic fire sprinkler systems shall be

in accordance with the requirements of the applicable referenced NFPA standard and this section.

903.3.1.4.1 Attics. Only dry-pipe, pre-action, or listed antifreeze automatic fire sprinkler systems
shall be allowed to protect attic spaces.

Exception: Wet-pipe fire sprinkler systems shall be allowed to protect non-ventilated attic
spaces where:

1. The attic sprinklers are supplied by a separate floor control valve assembly to allow ease
of draining the attic system without impairing sprinklers throughout the rest of the
building, and

2. Adequate heat shall be provided for freeze protection as per the applicable referenced
NFPA standard, and

3. The attic space is a part of the building's thermal, or heat, envelope, such that insulation
is provided at the roof deck, rather than at the ceiling level.

903.3.1.4.2 Heat trace/insulation. Heat trace/insulation shall only be allowed where approved by
the fire code official for small sections of large diameter water-filled pipe.

(46) Section 903.3.5; add a second paragraph to read as follows:

[F] Water supply as required for such systems shall be provided in conformance with the supply
requirements of the respective standards; however, every water-based fire protection system shall be
designed with a 10 psi safety factor. Reference Section 507.4 for additional design requirements.

(47) Section 903.4; add a second paragraph after the exceptions to read as follows:

[F] Sprinkler and standpipe system water-flow detectors shall be provided for each floor tap to the
sprinkler system and shall cause an alarm upon detection of water flow for more than 45 seconds. All
control valves in the sprinkler and standpipe systems except for fire department hose connection valves
shall be electrically supervised to initiate a supervisory signal at the central station upon tampering.

(48) Section 903.4.2; add second paragraph to read as follows:

[F] The alarm device required on the exterior of the building shall be a weatherproof horn/strobe
notification appliance with a minimum 75 candela strobe rating, installed as close as practicable to the fire
department connection.

(49) Section 905.2; change to read as follows:

[F] 905.2 Installation standard. Standpipe systems shall be installed in accordance with this section and
NFPA 14. Manual dry standpipe systems shall be supervised with a minimum of 10 psig and a maximum
of 40 psig air pressure with a high/low alarm.

(50) Section 905.3; add Section 905.3.9 and exception to read as follows:



[F] 905.3.9 Buildings exceeding 10,000 sq. ft. In buildings exceeding 10,000 square feet in area per
story and where any portion of the building's interior area is more than 150 feet (45,720 mm) of travel,
vertically and horizontally, from the nearest point of fire department vehicle access, Class I automatic wet
or manual wet standpipes shall be provided.

Exception:

1. Automatic dry and semi-automatic dry standpipes are allowed as provided for in NFPA
14.

(51) Section 905.4, change Item 1., 3., and 5. and add Item 7. to read as follows:

[F] 1. In every required exit stairway, a hose connection shall be provided for each story above and below
grade plane. Hose connections shall be located at an intermediate landing between stories, unless
otherwise approved by the fire code official.

2. {No change.}
3. In every exit passageway, at the entrance from the exit passageway to other areas of a building.

Exception: Where floor areas adjacent to an exit passageway are reachable from an exit stairway
hose connection by a ...... {No change to rest.}

4. {No change.}

5. Where the roof has a slope less than four units vertical in 12 units horizontal (33.3-percent slope), each
standpipe shall be provided with a two-way a hose connection shall be located to serve the roof or at the
highest landing of an interior exit stairway with stair access to the roof provided in accordance with
Section 1011.12.

6. {No change.}

7. When required by this Chapter, standpipe connections shall be placed adjacent to all required exits to
the structure and at one-hundred fifty feet (150') intervals along major corridors thereafter, or as otherwise
approved by the fire code official.

(52) Section 905.9; add a second paragraph after the exceptions to read as follows:

[F] Sprinkler and standpipe system water-flow detectors shall be provided for each floor tap to the
sprinkler system and shall cause an alarm upon detection of water flow for more than 45 seconds. All
control valves in the sprinkler and standpipe systems except for fire department hose connection valves
shall be electrically supervised to initiate a supervisory signal at the central station upon tampering.

(53) Add the following:

907.1.4 Design Standards. All alarm systems new or replacement serving 20 or more alarm actuation
devices shall be addressable fire detection systems. Alarm systems serving more than 40 smoke detectors
or more than 100 total alarm activating devices shall be analog intelligent addressable fire detection
systems. Exception: existing systems need not comply unless the total building remodel or expansion
initiated after adoption of this code, as adopted, exceeds 30% of the building. When cumulative building
remodel or expansion exceeds 50% of the building, occupant must comply within 18 months of permit
application.

(54) Section 907.2.1; change to read as follows:

[F] 907.2.1 Group A. A manual fire alarm system that activates the occupant notification system in
accordance with Section 907.5 shall be installed in Group A occupancies having an occupant load of 300
or more persons or more than 100 persons above or below the lowest level of exit discharge. Group A
occupancies not separated from one another in accordance with Section 707.3.10 of the International



Building Code shall be considered as a single occupancy for the purposes of applying this section.
Portions of Group E occupancies occupied for assembly purposes shall be provided with a fire alarm
system as required for the Group E occupancy.

Exception: {No change.}
Activation of fire alarm notification appliances shall:

1. Cause illumination of the means of egress with light of not less than 1 foot-candle (11 lux) at the
walking surface level, and

2. Stop any conflicting or confusing sounds and visual distractions.

(55) Section 907.2.3; change to read as follows:

[F] 907.2.3 Group E. A manual fire alarm system that initiates the occupant notification signal utilizing
an emergency voice/alarm communication system meeting the requirements of Section 907.5.2.2 and
installed in accordance with Section 907.6 shall be installed in Group E educational occupancies. When
automatic sprinkler systems or smoke detectors are installed, such systems or detectors shall be connected
to the building fire alarm system. An approved smoke detection system shall be installed in Group E day
care occupancies. Unless separated by a minimum of 100' open space, all buildings, whether portable
buildings or the main building, will be considered one building for alarm occupant load consideration and
interconnection of alarm systems.

Exceptions:

1. A manual fire alarm system is not required in Group E educational and day care occupancies with
a load of 30 or less when provided with an approved automatic sprinkler system.

1.1. Residential In-Home day care with not more than 12 children may use interconnected
single station detectors in all habitable rooms. (For care of more than five children 2 1/2 or less
years of age, see Section 907.2.6.)

{No change to remainder of exceptions.}

(56) Section 907.2.13, Exception 3; change to read as follows:

[F] 3. Open air portions of buildings with an occupancy in Group A-5 in accordance with Section 303.1
of the International Building Code; however, this exception does not apply to accessory uses including
but not limited to sky boxes, restaurants and similarly enclosed areas.

(57) Section 907.4.2; add Section 907.4.2.7 to read as follows:
[F] 907.4.2.7 Type. Manual alarm initiating devices shall be an approved double action type.

(58) Section 907.6.1; add Section 907.6.1.1 to read as follows:

[F] 907.6.1.1 Wiring Installation. All fire alarm systems shall be installed in such a manner that a failure
of any single initiating device or single open in an initiating circuit conductor will not interfere with the
normal operation of other such devices. All signaling line circuits (SLC) shall be installed in such a way
that a single open will not interfere with the operation of any addressable devices (Class A). Outgoing and
return SLC conductors shall be installed in accordance with NFPA 72 requirements for Class A circuits
and shall have a minimum of four feet separation horizontal and one-foot vertical between supply and
return circuit conductors. The initiating device circuit (IDC) from a signaling line circuit interface device
may be wired Class B, provided the distance from the interface device to the initiating device is ten feet or
less.

(59) Section 907.6.3; delete all four Exceptions.
(60) Section 907.6.6; - add sentence at end of paragraph to read as follows:

[F] See 907.6.3 for the required information transmitted to the supervising station.



(61) Section [F] 907.6.5.3 Communication requirements. All alarm systems, new or replacement, shall
transmit alarm, supervisory and trouble signals descriptively to the approved central station, remote
supervisory station or proprietary supervising station as defined in NFPA 72, with the correct device
designation and location of addressable device identification. Alarms shall not be permitted to be
transmitted as a General Alarm or Zone condition.

(62) Section 909.22; add to read as follows:

[F] 909.22 Stairway or ramp pressurization alternative. Where the building is equipped throughout
with an automatic sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 and the stair pressurization
alternative is chosen for compliance with Building Code requirements for a smoke-proof enclosure,
interior exit stairways or ramps shall be pressurized to a minimum of 0.10 inches of water (25 Pa) and a
maximum of 0.35 inches of water (87 Pa) in the shaft relative to the building measured with all interior
exit stairway and ramp doors closed under maximum anticipated conditions of stack effect and wind
effect. Such systems shall comply with Section 909, including the installation of a separate fire-fighter's
smoke control panel as per Section 909.16, and a Smoke Control Permit shall be required from the Fire
Department as per Section 105.7.

[F] 909.22.1 Ventilating equipment. The activation of ventilating equipment for the stair or ramp
pressurization system shall be by smoke detectors installed at each floor level at an approved location at
the entrance to the smoke-proof enclosure. When the closing device for the stairway or ramp shaft and
vestibule doors is activated by smoke detection or power failure, mechanical equipment shall activate and
operate at the required performance levels. Smoke detectors shall be installed in accordance with Section
907.3.

[F] 909.22.1.1 Ventilation systems. Smoke-proof enclosure ventilation systems shall be independent of
other building ventilation systems. The equipment, control wiring, power wiring and ductwork shall
comply with one of the following:

1. Equipment, control wiring, power wiring and ductwork shall be located exterior to the building
and directly connected to the smoke-proof enclosure or connected to the smoke-proof enclosure by
ductwork enclosed by not less than 2-hour fire barriers constructed in accordance with Section 707
of the Building Code or horizontal assemblies constructed in accordance with Section 711 of the
Building Code, or both.

2. Equipment, control wiring, power wiring and ductwork shall be located within the smoke-proof
enclosure with intake or exhaust directly from and to the outside or through ductwork enclosed North
Central Texas Council of Governments 13 As of August 2015 IBC Amendments by not less than 2-
hour barriers constructed in accordance with Section 707 of the Building Code or horizontal
assemblies constructed in accordance with Section 711 of the Building Code, or both.

3. Equipment, control wiring, power wiring and ductwork shall be located within the building if
separated from the remainder of the building, including other mechanical equipment, by not less than
2-hour fire barriers constructed in accordance with Section 707 of the Building Code or horizontal
assemblies constructed in accordance with Section 711 of the Building Code, or both.

Exceptions:

1. Control wiring and power wiring utilizing a 2-hour rated cable or cable system. 2. Where encased
with not less than 2 inches (51 mm) of concrete. 3. Control wiring and power wiring protected by a
listed electrical circuit protective systems with a fire-resistance rating of not less than 2 hours.

[F] 909.22.1.2 Standby power. Mechanical vestibule and stairway and ramp shaft ventilation systems
and automatic fire detection systems shall be provided with standby power in accordance with Section
2702 of the Building Code.

[F] 909.22.1.3 Acceptance and testing. Before the mechanical equipment is approved, the system shall
be tested in the presence of the fire code official to confirm that the system is operating in compliance
with these requirements.



(63) Section 910.2; amend Exception 2. and 3.to read as follows:

[F] 2. Only manual smoke and heat removal shall be required in areas of buildings equipped with early
suppression fast-response (ESFR) sprinklers. Automatic smoke and heat removal is prohibited.

3. Only manual smoke and heat removal shall not be required in areas of buildings equipped with control
mode special application sprinklers with a response time index of 50(m *S)1/2 or less that are listed to
control a fire in stored commodities with 12 or fewer sprinklers. Automatic smoke and heat removal is

prohibited.

(64) Section 910.2; add subsections 910.2.3 with exceptions to read as follows:
[F] 910.2.3 Group H. Buildings and portions thereof used as a Group H occupancy as follows:

1. In occupancies classified as Group H-2 or H-3, any of which are more than 15,000 square feet
(1394 m2) in single floor area. Exception: Buildings of noncombustible construction containing only
noncombustible materials.

2. In areas of buildings in Group H used for storing Class 2, 3, and 4 liquid and solid oxidizers, Class
1 and unclassified detonable organic peroxides, Class 3 and 4 unstable (reactive) materials, or Class
2 or 3 water-reactive materials as required for a high-hazard commodity classification.

Exception: Buildings of noncombustible construction containing only noncombustible materials.

[F] 910.2.4 Exit access travel distance increase. Buildings and portions thereof used as a Group F-1 or
S-1 occupancy where the maximum exit access travel distance is increased in accordance with Section

1016.2.2.

(65) Section 910.3; add section 910.3.4 to read as follows:

[F] 910.3.4 Vent operation. Smoke and heat vents shall be capable of being operated by approved
automatic and manual means. Automatic operation of smoke and heat vents shall conform to the

provisions of Sections 910.3.2.1 through 910.3.2.3.

[F] 910.3.4.1 Sprinklered buildings. Where installed in buildings equipped with an approved automatic
sprinkler system, smoke and heat vents shall be designed to operate automatically. The automatic
operating mechanism of the smoke and heat vents shall operate at a temperature rating at least 100
degrees F (approximately 38 degrees Celsius) greater than the temperature rating of the sprinklers

installed.
Exception: Manual only system per 910.2

[F] 910.3.4.2 Non-sprinklered buildings. Where installed in buildings not equipped with an approved
automatic sprinkler system, smoke and heat vents shall operate automatically by actuation of a heat-
responsive device rated at between 100°F (56°C) and 220°F (122°C) above ambient.

Exception: Listed gravity-operated drop out vents.

(66) Section 910.4.3.1; amend to read as follows:

[F] 910.4.3.1 Makeup air. Makeup air openings shall be provided within 6 feet (1829 mm) of the floor
level. Operation of makeup air openings shall be automatic. The minimum gross area of makeup air inlets
shall be 8 square feet per 1,000 cubic feet per minute (0.74 m2 per 0.4719 m3/s) of smoke exhaust.

(67) Section 910.4.4; amend to read as follows:

[F] 910.4.4 Activation. The mechanical smoke removal system shall be activated automatically by the
automatic sprinkler system or by an approved fire detection system. Individual manual controls shall also

be provided.

Exception: Manual only systems per Section 910.2.



(68) Section 912.2; add Section 912.2.3 to read as follows:

[F] 912.2.3 Hydrant distance. An approved fire hydrant shall be located within 100 feet of the fire
department connection as the fire hose lays along an unobstructed path.

(69) Section 913.2.1; add second paragraph and exception to read as follows:

[F] When located on the ground level at an exterior wall, the fire pump room shall be provided with an
exterior fire department access door that is not less than 3 ft. in width and 6 ft. - 8 in. in height, regardless
of any interior doors that are provided. A key box shall be provided at this door, as required by Section
506.1.

Exception: When it is necessary to locate the fire pump room on other levels or not at an exterior
wall, the corridor leading to the fire pump room access from the exterior of the building shall be
provided with equivalent fire resistance as that required for the pump room, or as approved by the
fire code official. Access keys shall be provided in the key box as required by Section 506.1.

(70) Section 1006.2.2.6 Added a new Section 1006.2.2.6 as follows:

1006.2.2.6 Electrical Rooms. For electrical rooms, special exiting requirements may apply. Reference
the electrical code as adopted.

(71) Section 1009.1; add the following Exception 4:

Exceptions:

{previous exceptions unchanged}

4. Buildings regulated under State Law and built in accordance with State registered plans, including any
variances or waivers granted by the State, shall be deemed to be in compliance with the requirements of
Section 1009. '

(72) Section 1010.1.9.4 Bolt Locks; amended exceptions 3 and 4 as follows:

Exceptions:

3. Where a pair of doors serves an occupant load of less than 50 persons in a Group B, F, M or S
occupancy.

{Remainder unchanged}

4. Where a pair of doors serves a Group A, B, F, M or S occupancy.

{Remainder unchanged}

(73) Section 1015.8 Window Openings. Amend text as follows:

1. Operable windows where the top of the sill of the opening is located more than 55 feet (16 764 mm)
above the finished grade or other surface below and that are provided with window fall prevention
devices that comply with ASTM F 2006.

(74) Section 1029.1.1.1 Delete this section. Spaces under grandstands and bleachers;
(75) Section 1030.1; amend to read as follows:
1030.1 General. In addition to the means of egress required by this chapter, provisions shall be made for

emergency escape and rescue openings in Group R and I-1 occupancies. {Remainder unchanged.}

Exceptions:

{Exceptions 1 through 3 unchanged.}

4. In other than Group R-3 occupancies, buildings equipped throughout with an approved automatic
sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.3.1 or 903.3.1.2.

(76) Section 1101.1 Scope. add exception as follows:

Exception: Components of projects regulated by and registered with Architectural Barriers Division of
Texas Department of Licensing and Regulation shall be deemed to be incompliance with the requirements
of this chapter.



(77) Section 1203.1; amend to read as follows:

1203.1 General. Buildings shall be provided with natural ventilation in accordance with Section 1203 .4,
or mechanical ventilation in accordance with the International Mechanical Code. Where air infiltration
rate in a dwelling unit is 5 air changes or less per hour when tested with a blower door at a pressure 0.2
inch w.c. (50 Pa) in accordance with Section 402.4.1.2 of the International Energy Conservation Code,
the dwelling unit shall be ventilated by mechanical means in accordance with Section 403 of the
International Mechanical Code.

(78) Table 1505.1; delete footnote ¢ and replace footnote b with the following:

b. Non-classified roof coverings shall be permitted on buildings of U occupancies having not more than
120 sq. ft. of protected roof area. When exceeding 120 sq. ft. of protected roof area, buildings of U
occupancies may use non-rated non-combustible roof coverings.

(79) Section 1505.7; delete the section.
(80) Section 1510.1; add a sentence to read as follows:

1510.1 General. Materials and methods of applications used for recovering or replacing an existing roof
covering shall comply with the requirements of Chapter 15. All individual replacement shingles or shakes
shall be in compliance with the rating required by Table 1505.1.

{text of exception unchanged}

(81) Add to the end of paragraph 1612.1, "Also refer to the City of Gainesville Flood Control Ordinance."
(82) Section 1704.2, Special inspections and tests is amended to read as follows:

1704.2 Special inspections and tests. Where application is made to the Building Official for construction
as specified in Section 105, the owner or the owner's authorized agent, or the registered design
professional in responsible charge, other than the contractor, shall employ one or more approved agencies
to provide special inspections and tests during construction on the types of work listed under Section
1705 and identify the approved agencies to the Building Official. The special inspector shall not be
employed by the contractor. These special inspections and tests are in addition to the inspections
identified by the Building Official that are identified in Section 110.

(83) Section 1704.2.1, Special inspector qualifications, is amended to read as follows:

1704.2.1 Special inspector qualifications. Prior to the start of construction and or upon request, the
approved agencies shall provide written documentation to the registered design professional in
responsible charge and the building official demonstrating the competence and relevant experience or
training of the special inspectors who will perform the special inspections and tests during construction.
[Remainder unchanged]

(84) Section 1704.2.4, Report requirement, is amended to read as follows:

1704.2.4 Report requirement. Approved agencies shall keep records of special inspections and tests.
The approved agency shall submit reports of special inspections and tests to the Building Official upon
request, and to the registered design professional in responsible charge. Individual inspection reports shall
indicate that work inspected or tested was or was not completed in conformance to approved construction
documents.

(85) Section 1704.2.5.2, Fabricator approval, is amended to read as follows:

1704.2.5.1 Fabricator approval. Special inspections during fabrications required by Section 1704 are
not required where the work is done on the premises of a fabricator registered and approved to perform
such work without special inspection. Approval shall be based upon review of the fabricator's written
procedural and quality control manuals and periodic auditing of fabrication practices by an approved
agency, or a fabricator that is enrolled in a nationally accepted inspections program. At completion of
fabrication, the acceptable or approved fabricator shall submit a certificate of compliance to the owner or
the owner's authorized agent or the registered design professional in responsible charge, stating that the



work was performed in accordance with the approved construction documents. The certificate of
compliance shall also be made available to the Building Official upon request.

(86) Section 2901.1; add a sentence to read as follows:

[P] 2901.1 Scope. {existing text to remain} The provisions of this Chapter are meant to work in
coordination with the provisions of Chapter 4 of the International Plumbing Code. Should any conflicts
arise between the two chapters, the Building Official shall determine which provision applies.

(87) Section 2902.1; add a second paragraph to read as follows:

In other than E Occupancies, the minimum number of fixtures in Table 2902.1 may be lowered, if

requested in writing, by the applicant stating reasons for a reduced number and approved by the Building
Official.

(88) Table 2902.1; add footnote f to read as follows:

f. Drinking fountains are not required in M Occupancies with an occupant load of 100 or less, B
Occupancies with an occupant load of 25 or less, and for dining and/or drinking establishments.

(89) Section 2902.1.3; add new Section 2902.1.3 to read as follows:

2902.1.3 Additional fixtures for food preparation facilities. In addition to the fixtures required in this
Chapter, all food service facilities shall be provided with additional fixtures set out in this section.

2902.1.3.1 Hand washing lavatory. At least one hand washing lavatory shall be provided for use by
employees that is accessible from food preparation, food dispensing and ware washing areas. Additional
hand washing lavatories may be required based on convenience of use by employees.

2902.1.3.2 Service sink. In new or remodeled food service establishments, at least one service sink or one
floor sink shall be provided so that it is conveniently located for the cleaning of mops or similar wet floor
cleaning tool and for the disposal of mop water and similar liquid waste. The location of the service
sink(s) and/or mop sink(s) shall be approved by the State of Texas health department.

(90) Section 3002.1 Hoist way Enclosure Protection; add exceptions to read as follows:

Exceptions:

1. Elevators wholly located within atriums complying with Section 404 shall not require hoistway
enclosure protection.

2. Elevators in open or enclosed parking garages that serve only the parking garage, and complying with
Sections 406.5 and 406.6, respectively, shall not require hoistway enclosure protection.

(91) Section 3005.4 Machine rooms, control rooms, machinery spaces and control spaces.

Revise text to read:

Elevator machine rooms, control rooms, control spaces and machinery spaces shall be enclosed with fire
barriers constructed in accordance with Section 707 or horizontal assemblies constructed in accordance
with Section 711, or both.

[Remainder unchanged]
(92) Section 3005.7; add Section 3005.7 as follows:

3005.7 Fire Protection in Machine rooms, control rooms, machinery spaces and control spaces.

3005.7.1 Automatic sprinkler system. The building shall be equipped throughout with an automatic
sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1, except as otherwise permitted by Section
903.3.1.1.1 and as prohibited by Section 3005.7.2.1.



3005.7.2.1 Prohibited locations. Automatic sprinklers shall not be installed in machine rooms, elevator
machinery spaces, control rooms, control spaces and elevator hoist-ways.

3005.7.2.2 Sprinkler system monitoring. The sprinkler system shall have a sprinkler control valve
supervisory switch and water-flow initiating device provided for each floor that is monitored by the
building's fire alarm system.

3005.7.3 Water protection. An approved method to prevent water from infiltrating into the hoistway
enclosure from the operation of the automatic sprinkler system outside the elevator lobby shall be
provided.

3005.7.4 Shunt trip. Means for elevator shutdown in accordance with Section 3005.5 shall not be
installed.

(93) Section 3005.8; add Section 3005.8 as follows:

3005.8 Storage. Storage shall not be allowed within the elevator machine room, control room, machinery
spaces and or control spaces. Provide approved signage at each entry to the above listed locations stating:
"No Storage Allowed."

(94) Section 3006.2, Hoist way opening protection required; Revise text as follows:

5. The building is a high rise and the elevator hoist way is more than 55 feet (16 764 mm) in height. The
height of the hoist way shall be measured from the lowest floor at or above grade to the highest floors
served by the hoist way.

(95) Section 3109.1; change to read as follows:

3109.1 General. Swimming pools shall comply with the requirements of sections 3109.2 through 3109.5
and other applicable sections of this code and complying with applicable state laws.

(96) 3401.5 Alternative Compliance; change to read as follows:

3401.5 Alternative Compliance. Work performed in accordance with the International Existing Building
Code shall be deemed to comply with the provisions of this chapter with prior approval from the Building

Official.

(97) Section 3401.5 Dangerous Conditions; change to read as follows:

Section 3401.6 Dangerous Conditions; {Remainder unchanged.}

(98) Delete paragraph 3410.1 Moved Structures; add new 3410.1 Conformance; to read as follows:
Structures being moved into or within the City Limits of Gainesville shall comply with the standards
adopted in City Code of Ordinances Article I, Section 5-11 - Moving Structures.

(99) 3412.2 Applicability, change to read, Structures existing prior to the effective date of this Ordinance in
which there is work.......[ {Remainder unchanged.}

(100) Delete paragraph C102.1 General; add new C102.1 General, to read as follows:
Buildings classified as Group U Agriculture shall respect established height limits and setbacks as

established in the most currently adopted zoning regulations per City of Gainesville Code of Ordinances.

Sec. 5-4. - Specific amendments to the 2018 International Residential Code.
(1) Section R102.4; change to read as follows:

R102.4 Referenced codes and standards. The codes, when specifically adopted, and
standards referenced in this code shall be considered part of the requirements of this code to
the prescribed extent of each such reference and as further regulated in Sections R102.4.1
and R102.4.2. Whenever amendments have been adopted to the referenced codes and
standards, each reference to said code and standard shall be considered to reference the



amendments as well. Any reference made to NFPA 70 or the Electrical Code shall mean the
Electrical Code as adopted.

(2) Section R104.10.1 Flood Hazard areas; delete this section.

(3) Section R105.3.1.1 & R106.1.4; delete these sections re: floodplain.

(4) Section R110 (R110.1 through R110.5); delete these sections re: residential COs.
(5) Section R112.2.1 & R112.2.2; delete these sections re: floodplain.

(6) Section R202; change definition of "Townhouse" to read as follows:

TOWNHOUSE. A single-family dwelling unit constructed in a group of three or more
attached units separated by property lines in which each unit extends from foundation to roof
and with a yard or public way on at least two sides.

(7) Table R301.2 (1); fill in as follows:

z,
GROU WIND SEISMI | SUBJECT TO g (& 1 % 2
ND DESIGN C DAMAGE FROM Z 5 21 aZ | Qs -
SNOW 2 | DESIG SRR o% =5 =
LOAD |SPEE |2 |2 |5 |N L 2, 4= m,%:SN @2 > &
D'\ BE O CATE | E | BB BT SIREIER IS
(MPH) | &.8| 5§ £ £/ GORY' s | e~ | E & |5 = =
S5 34 8N 5 | ~gle |B T <
SHA 24 5 $ £ | &
5 Ib/ft S N = A —
=
o= o 22°F [No |Local | 150 | 64.9°
|z No |[No | No g 6” Very Code F
an
" 3 o 2 Heavy
=g p>

Delete remainder of table Manual J Design Criteria and footnote N
(8) Section R302.1; add exception #6 to read as follows:
Exceptions: {previous exceptions unchanged}

6.  Open non-combustible carport structures may be constructed when also approved within adopted
ordinances.

(9) Section R302.3; add Exception #3 to read as follows:

Exceptions:
1. {existing text unchanged}

2. ({existing text unchanged}

3. Two-family dwelling units that are also divided by a property line through the structure
shall be separated as required for townhouses

(10) Section R302.5.1; change to read as follows:

R302.5.1 Opening protection. Openings from a private garage directly into a room used for
sleeping purposes shall not be permitted. Other openings between the garage and residence
shall be equipped with solid wood doors not less than 13/8 inches (35 mm) in thickness, solid
or honeycomb core steel doors not less than 13/8 inches (35 mm) thick, or 20-minute fire-
rated doors.

(11) Section R303.3, Exception; amend to read as follows:




Exception: {existing text unchanged} Spaces containing only a water closet or water closet
and a lavatory may be ventilated with an approved mechanical recirculating fan or similar
device designed to remove odors from the air.

(12) Section R313.2 One and Two Family Dwellings; Delete this section and subsection in their
entirety.

(13) Section R315.2.2 Alterations, repairs and additions; amend to read as follows:
Exception:
1. [existing text remains]

2. Installation, alteration or repairs of all electrically powered mechanical systems or
plumbing appliances.

(14) Section R322 Flood Resistant Construction; delete section.
(15) Section R401.2; amended by adding a new paragraph following the existing paragraph to read as follows.
Section R401.2. Requirements. {existing text unchanged}

Every foundation and/or footing, or any size addition to an existing post-tension foundation, regulated by
this code shall be designed and sealed by a Texas-registered engineer.

(16) Section R602.6.1; amend the following:

R602.6.1 Drilling and notching of top plate. When piping or ductwork is placed in or partly
in an exterior wall or interior load-bearing wall, necessitating cutting, drilling or notching of
the top plate by more than 50 percent of its width, a galvanized metal tie not less than 0.054
inch thick (1.37 mm) (16 Ga) and 1 % inches (38) mm 5 inches (127 mm) wide shall be fastened
across and to the plate at each side of the opening with not less than eight 10d (0.148 inch
diameter) having a minimum length of 1 % inches (38 mm) at each side or equivalent. Fasteners
will be offset to prevent splitting of the top plate material. The metal tie must extend a minimum
of 6 inches past the opening. See figure R602.6.1. {remainder unchanged}

(17) Figure R602.6.1; delete the figure and insert the following figure:

CXTERIOR OR DEARNG WALL
\

WOTCH GREATER THAN 53
PERCENT OF TRE PLATE WIOTN -

14 QALK [ 9% N AND 3 N WOC

METAL T FASTENED ACROSS AND
TO TNE PLATE AT EACH SOE OF Tne
NOTCH WITH 8100 NAX S EACH S0

TOP PLATES

el

(18) Add section R703.8.4.1.2 Veneer Ties for Wall Studs; to read as follows:

R703.8.4.1.2 Veneer Ties for Wall Studs. In stud framed exterior walls, all ties may be anchored to studs
as follows:

1. When studs are 16 in (407 mm) o.c., stud ties shall be spaced no further apart than 24 in (737 mm)
vertically starting approximately 12 in (381 mm) from the foundation; or



2. When studs are 24 in (610 mm) o.c., stud ties shall be spaced no further apart than 16 in (483 mm)
vertically starting approximately 8 in (254 mm) from the foundation.

(19) Section R902.1; amend and add exception #5 to read as follows:

R902.1 Roofing covering materials. Roofs shall be covered with materials as set forth in
Sections R904 and R905. Class A, B, or C roofing shall be installed in designated by law as
requiring their use or when the edge of the roof is less than 3 feet from a lot line. {remainder

unchanged}
Exceptions:
1. {text unchanged}
2. {text unchanged}
3 {téxt unchanged}
4. {text unchanged}
5

Non-classified roof coverings shall be permitted on one-story detached accessory
structures used as tool and storage sheds, playhouses and similar uses, provided the floor
area does not exceed (area defined by jurisdiction).

(20) Chapter 11 [RE] — Energy Efficiency is deleted in its entirety; Reference the 2018 IECC for
energy code provisions and recommended amendments.

(21) Section M1305.1.2; change to read as follows:

M1305.1.2 Appliances in attics. Attics containing appliances shall be provided . . . {bulk of
paragraph unchanged} . . . side of the appliance. The clear access opening dimensions shall
be a minimum of 20 inches by 30 inches (508 mm by 762 mm), and large enough to allow
removal of the largest appliance. As a minimum, for access to the attic space, provide one of

the following:

1. A permanent stair.

2. A pull down stair with a minimum 300 Ib (136 kg) capacity.

3. An access door from an upper floor level.

Exceptions:

1. The passageway and level service space are not required where the appliance can be
serviced and removed through the required opening.

2. Where the passageway is unobstructed... {remaining text unchanged}

(22) Section M1411.3; change to read as follows:

M1411.3 Condensate disposal. Condensate from all cooling coils or evaporators shall be
conveyed from the drain pan outlet to an approved place of disposal a sanitary sewer through a
trap, by means of a direct or indirect drain. {remaining text unchanged}

(23) Section M1411.3.1, Items 3 and 4; add text to read as follows:
M1411.3.1 Auxiliary and secondary drain systems. {bulk of paragraph unchanged}
1. {text unchanged}
2. {text unchanged}

3. Anauxiliary drain pan... {bulk of text unchanged} ... with Item 1 of this section. A water
level detection device may be installed only with prior approval of the building official.



4. A water level detection device... {bulk of text unchanged}... overflow rim of such pan.

A water level detection device may be installed only with prior approval of the building
official.

(24) Section M1411.3.1.1; add text to read as follows:

M1411.3.1.1 Water-level monitoring devices. On down-flow units ...{bulk of text
unchanged} ... installed in the drain line. A water level detection device may be installed only
with prior approval of the building official.

(25) M1503.6 Makeup Air Required; amend and add exception as follows:

M1503.6 Makeup air required. Where one or more gas, liquid or solid fuel-burning appliance that is neither
direct-vent nor uses a mechanical draft venting system is located within a dwelling unit’s air barrier, each
exhaust system capable of exhausting in excess of 400 cubic feet per minute (0.19 m3/s) shall be mechanically
or passively provided with makeup air at a rate approximate to the difference between exhaust air rate and
400 cubic feet per minute. Such makeup air systems shall be equipped with not fewer than one damper
complying with Section M1503.6.2.

Exception: Makeup air is not required for exhaust systems installed for the exclusive purpose of space
cooling and intended to be operated only when windows or other air inlets are open. Where all appliances in
the house are of sealed combustion, power-vent, unvented, or electric. the exhaust hood system shall be
permitted to exhaust up to 600 cubic feet per minute (0.28 m3/s) without providing makeup air. Exhaust hood
systems capable of exhausting in excess of 600 cubic feet per minute (0.28 m3/s) shall be provided with a
makeup air at a rate approximately to the difference between the exhaust air rate and 600 cubic feet per
minute.

(26) Section M2005.2; change to read as follows:

M2005.2 Prohibited locations. Fuel-fired water heaters shall not be installed in a room used as a storage
closet. Water heaters located in a bedroom or bathroom shall be installed in a sealed enclosure so that
combustion air will not be taken from the living space. Access to such enclosure may be from the bedroom
or bathroom when through a solid door, weather-stripped in accordance with the exterior door air leakage
requirements of the International Energy Conservation Code and equipped with an approved self-closing
device. Installation of direct-vent water heaters within an enclosure is not required.

(27) Section G2408.3 (305.5)Private Garages; delete this section in its entirety
(28) Section G2415.2.1 (404.2.1) CSST; add a second paragraph to read as follows:

Both ends of each section of medium pressure gas piping shall identify its operating gas
pressure with an approved tag. The tags are to be composed of aluminum or stainless steel and
the following wording shall be stamped into the tag:

"WARNING: 1/2 to 5 psi gas pressure - Do Not Remove"
(29) Section G2415.12 (404.12) and G2415.12.1 (404.12.1); change to read as follows:

G2415.12 (404.12) Minimum burial depth. Underground piping systems shall be installed a minimum depth
of 18 inches (457 mm) below grade.

G2415.12.1 (404.12.1) Individual Outdoor Appliances; Delete in its entirety
(30) Section G2417.1 (406.1); change to read as follows:

G2417.1 (406.1) General. Prior to acceptance and initial operation, all piping installations
shall be inspected and pressure tested to determine that the materials, design, fabrication, and
installation practices comply with the requirements of this code. The permit holder shall make
the applicable tests prescribed in Sections 2417.1.1 through 2417.1.5 to determine compliance
with the provisions of this code. The permit holder shall give reasonable advance notice to the
building official when the piping system is ready for testing. The equipment, material, power
and labor necessary for the inspections and test shall be furnished by the permit holder and the



permit holder shall be responsible for determining that the work will withstand the test pressure
prescribed in the following tests.

(31) Section G2417.4; change to read as follows:

G2417.4 (406.4) Test pressure measurement. Test pressure shall be measured with a
monometer or with a pressure-measuring device designed and calibrated to read, record, or
indicate a pressure loss caused by leakage during the pressure test period. The source of pressure
shall be isolated before the pressure tests are made. Mechanical gauges used to measure test
pressures shall have a range such that the highest end of the scale is not greater than five times
the test pressure.

(32) Section G2417.4.1; change to read as follows:

G2417.4.1 (406.4.1) Test pressure. The test pressure to be used shall be no less than 3 psig
(20 kPa gauge), or at the discretion of the Code Official, the piping and valves may be tested
at a pressure of at least six (6) inches (152 mm) of mercury, measured with a manometer or
slope gauge, irrespective of design pressure. Where the test pressure exceeds 125 psig (862
kPa gauge), the test pressure shall not exceed a value that produces a hoop stress in the piping
greater than 50 percent of the specified minimum yield strength of the pipe. For tests requiring
a pressure of 3 psig, diaphragm gauges shall utilize a dial with a minimum diameter of three
and one half inches (3 '4”), a set hand, 1/10 pound incrementation and pressure range not to
exceed 6 psi for tests requiring a pressure of 3 psig. For tests requiring a pressure of 10 psig,
diaphragm gauges shall utilize a dial with a minimum diameter of three and one-half inches (3
2”), a set hand, a minimum of 2/10 pound incrementation and a pressure range not to exceed
20 psi. For welded piping, and for piping carrying gas at pressures in excess of fourteen (14)
inches water column pressure (3.48 kPa) (1/2 psi) and less than 200 inches of water column
pressure (52.2 kPa) (7.5 psi), the test pressure shall not be less than ten (10) pounds per square
inch (69.6 kPa). For piping carrying gas at a pressure that exceeds 200 inches of water column
(52.2 kPa) (7.5 psi), the test pressure shall be not less than one and one-half times the proposed
maximum working pressure.

Diaphragm gauges used for testing must display a current calibration and be in good working
condition. The appropriate test must be applied to the diaphragm gauge used for testing

(33) Section G2417.4.2; change to read as follows:

G2417.4.2 (406.4.2) Test duration. The test duration shall be held for a length of time
satisfactory to the Building Official, but in no case for be not less than 10 fifteen (15) minutes.
For welded piping, and for piping carrying gas at pressures in excess of fourteen (14) inches
water column pressure (3.48 kPa), the test duration shall be held for a length of time satisfactory
to the Building Official, but in no case for less than thirty (30) minutes.

(34) Section G2420.1 (406.1); add Section G2420.1.4 to read as follows:

G2420.1.4 Valves in CSST installations. Shutoff valves installed with corrugated stainless
steel (CSST) piping systems shall be supported with an approved termination fitting, or
equivalent support, suitable for the size of the valves, of adequate strength and quality, and
located at intervals so as to prevent or damp out excessive vibration but in no case greater than
12-inches from the center of the valve. Supports shall be installed so as not to interfere with the
free expansion and contraction of the system's piping, fittings, and valves between anchors. All
valves and supports shall be designed and installed so they will not be disengaged by movement
of the supporting piping.

(35) Section G2420.5.1 (409.5.1); add text to read as follows:

G2420.5.1 (409.5.1) Located within the same room. The shutoff valve... {bulk of paragraph
unchanged}... in accordance with the appliance manufacturer’s instructions. A secondary



shutoff valve must be installed within 3 feet (914 mm) of the firebox if appliance shutoff is
located in the firebox.

(36) Section G2421.1 (410.1); add text and Exception to read as follows:

G2421.1 (410.1) Pressure regulators. A line pressure regulator shall be ... {bulk of paragraph
unchanged}... approved for outdoor installation. Access to regulators shall comply with the
requirements for access to appliances as specified in Section M1305.

Exception: A passageway or level service space is not required when the regulator is capable
of being serviced and removed through the required attic opening.

(37) Section G2422.1.2.3 (411.1.3.3) Prohibited locations and penetrations; delete Exception 1
and Exception 4.

(38) Section G2445.2 (621.2); add Exception to read as follows:

(G2445.2 (621.2) Prohibited use. One or more unvented room heaters shall not be used as the
sole source of comfort heating in a dwelling unit.

Exception: Existing approved unvented room heaters may continue to be used in dwelling
units, in accordance with the code provisions in effect when installed, when approved by the
Building Official unless an unsafe condition is determined to exist as described in International
Fuel Gas Code Section 108.7 of the Fuel Gas Code.

(39) Section G2448.1.1 (624.1.1); change to read as follows:

G2448.1.1 (624.1.1) Installation requirements. The requirements for water heaters relative to
access, sizing, relief valves, drain pans and scald protection shall be in accordance with this code.

(40) Section P2603; add to read as follows:

P2603.3 Protection against corrosion. Metallic piping, except for cast iron, ductile iron and
galvanized steel, shall not be placed in direct contact with steel framing members, concrete or
cinder walls and floors or other masonry. Metallic piping shall not be placed in direct contact
with corrosive soil. Where sheathing is used to prevent direct contact, the sheathing shall have
a thickness of not less than 0.008 inch (8 mil) (0.203 mm) and the sheathing shall be made of
approved material plastic. Where sheathing protects piping that penetrates concrete or masonry
walls or floors, the sheathing shall be installed in a manner that allows movement of the piping
within the sheathing.

(41) Section P2604; add to read as follows:

P2604.2.1 Plastic sewer and DWYV piping installation. Plastic sewer and DWV piping
installed underground shall be installed in accordance with the manufacturer’s installation
instructions. Trench width shall be controlled to not exceed the outside the pipe diameter plus
16 inches or in a trench which has a controlled width equal to the nominal diameter of the
piping multiplied by 1.25 plus 12 inches. The piping shall be bedded in 4 inches of granular
fill and then backfilled compacting the side fill in 6-inch layers on each side of the piping. The
compaction shall be to minimum of 85 percent standard proctor density and extend to a
minimum of 6 inches above the top of the pipe.

(42) Section P2801; change to read as follows:
P2801.6 Required pan.

Where a storage tank-type water heater or a hot water storage tank is installed in a location
where water leakage from the tank will cause damage, the tank shall be installed in a pan
constructed of one of the following:

1. Galvanized steel or aluminum of not less than 0.0236 inch (0.6010 mm) in thickness.



2. Plastic not less than 0.036 inch (0.9 mm) in thickness.
3. Other approved materials.
(43) Section P2801.6.1; change to read as follows:

Section P2801.6.1 Pan size and drain. The pan shall be not less than 11/2 inches (38 mm) in
depth and shall be of sufficient size and shape to receive all dripping or condensate from the
tank or water heater. The pan shall be drained by an indirect waste pipe having a diameter of

not less than 3/4 inch (19 mm). Piping for safety pan drains shall be of those materials listed in
Table P2906.5.

Multiple pan drains may terminate to a single discharge piping system when approved by the
administrative authority and permitted by the manufactures installation instructions and
installed with those instructions. {existing text unchanged}

(44) Section P2902.5.3; change to read as follows:

P2902.5.3 Lawn irrigation systems. The potable water supply to lawn irrigation systems shall
be protected against backflow by an atmospheric-type vacuum breaker, a pressure-type vacuum
breaker, a double-check assembly or a reduced pressure principle backflow preventer. A valve
shall not be installed downstream from an atmospheric vacuum breaker. Where chemicals are
introduced into the system, the potable water supply shall be protected against backflow by a
reduced pressure principle backflow preventer.

(45) Section P3003.9; change to read as follows:

P3003.9.2 Solvent cementing. Joint surfaces shall be clean and free from moisture. A purple
primer that conforms to ASTM F 656 shall be applied. Solvent cement not purple in color and
conforming to ASTM D 2564, CSA B137.3, CSA B181.2 or CSA B182.1 shall be applied to all
joint surfaces. The joint shall be made while the cement is wet and shall be in accordance with
ASTM D 2855. Solvent cement joints shall be permitted above or below ground.

(46) Section P3111Combination waste and vent systems; delete this section in its entirety.
(47) Section P3112.2 Vent Collection; delete and replace with the following:

P3112.2 Installation. Traps for island sinks and similar equipment shall be roughed in above
the floor and may be vented by extending the vent as high as possible, but not less than the
drainboard height and then returning it downward and connecting it to the horizontal sink drain
immediately downstream from the vertical fixture drain. The return vent shall be connected to
the horizontal drain through a wye-branch fitting and shall, in addition, be provided with a foot
vent taken off the vertical fixture vent by means of a wye-branch immediately below the floor
and extending to the nearest partition and then through the roof to the open air or may be
connected to other vents at a point not less than six (6) inches (152 mm) above the flood level
rim of the fixtures served. Drainage fittings shall be used on all parts of the vent below the floor
level and a minimum slope of one-quarter (1/4) inch per foot (20.9 mm/m) back to the drain shall
be maintained. The return bend used under the drain-board shall be a one (1) piece fitting or an
assembly of a forty-five (45) degree (0.79 radius), a ninety (90) degree (1.6 radius) and a forty-
five (45) degree (0.79 radius) elbow in the order named. Pipe sizing shall be as elsewhere
required in this Code. The island sink drain, upstream of the return vent, shall serve no other
fixtures. An accessible cleanout shall be installed in the vertical portion of the foot vent.

Sec. 5-5. — Specific amendments to the 2018 Existing Building Code.
None.

Sec. 5-6. - Specific amendments to the 2018 International Fire Code.

[Specific amendments:]



(1) 102.1 Existing Structures - Construction and Design Provisions:

)

“4)

(6)

(7

Amend: Section 102.1 ; change #3 to read as follows:

3. Existing structures, facilities, and conditions when required in Chapter 11 or in specific sections of
this code.

Add:
(5) Additions, Alterations, Renovations;

(a) Any addition, renovation, remodel that adds square footage to a building, such structure is
now subject to all fire protection requirements as though it were new construction.

(b) Any alteration or renovation that changes the occupancy floorplan or increases the occupancy
load of the structure is now subject to all fire protection requirements as though it were new
construction.

(c) Any renovation or remodel that does not change the occupancy floorplan, occupancy
classification, or increase the occupancy load of the structure shall be considered pre-existing
compliant from having to meet fire current fire protection requirements for new construction.

105.1.1 Permits Required: Replace - "Fire Code Official" with "Community Development Department upon
approval of the Fire Code Official".

105.4.1.1a Examination of Documents: Add - The Fire Code Official is authorized to require a third party
review on submittals and documents. The third party reviewer shall be pre-approved by the Fire Code
Official. All fees for the third party review shall be the responsibility of the submitter.

Section 105.7 ; add Section 105.7.19 to read as follows:

105.7.26 Electronic access control systems. Construction permits are required for the installation or
modification of an electronic access control system, as specified in Chapter 10. A separate construction
permit is required for the installation or modification of a fire alarm system that may be connected to the
access control system. Maintenance performed in accordance with this code is not considered a modification
and does not require a permit.

202 General Definitions; add

[B] AMBULATORY CARE FACILITY. Buildings or portions thereof used to provide medical, surgical,
psychiatric, nursing, or similar care on a less than 24-hour basis to persons who are rendered incapable of self-
preservation by the services provided. This group may include but not be limited to the following:

- Dialysis centers
- Procedures involving sedation
- Sedation dentistry
- Surgery centers
- Colonic centers
- Psychiatric centers
{Remainder unchanged.}
[B] ATRIUM. An opening connecting three or more stories... {remaining text unchanged}

[B] DEFEND IN PLACE. A method of emergency response that engages building components and trained
staff to provide occupant safety during an emergency. Emergency response involves remaining in place,
relocating within the building, or both, without evacuating the building.



FIRE WATCH. A temporary measure intended to ensure continuous and systematic surveillance of a building
or portion thereof by one or more qualified individuals or standby personnel when required by the fire code
official, for the purposes of identifying and controlling fire hazards, detecting early signs of unwanted fire,
raising an alarm of fire and notifying the fire department.

FIREWORKS. Any composition or device for the purpose of producing a visible or an audible effect for
entertainment purposes by combustion, deflagration, detonation, and/or ac<ns1:XMLFault xmlns:ns1="http://cxf.apache.org/bindings/xformat"><ns1:faultstring xmlns:ns1="http://cxf.apache.org/bindings/xformat">java.lang.OutOfMemoryError: Java heap space</ns1:faultstring></ns1:XMLFault>